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Choosing the right e-liquid flavor is one of the primary steps in satisfaction with vaping. Since
there are many different options available on the market these days, sometimes it can be a kind of
overwhelming problem, especially for complete beginners. The right flavor can greatly enhance
enjoyment while an incorrect choice may lead to dissatisfaction. Various points discussed herein
will enable you in choosing the e-liquid flavor that best suits your style of vaping.

Understanding Your Preferences

First and foremost, the selection of the flavor regarding e-liquids is all about knowing one’s taste.
Much as different types of food or drinks would be selected by people, different flavor inclinations
normally exist in every person. Some may like sweet fruity flavors, while others might prefer
dessert or tobacco-based flavors. Take the time to reflect upon your usual preferences in other
aspects of your life regarding food and beverages. If you have a sweet tooth for candies or pastries,
then the dessert e-liquid would more likely fit best for you. Those who enjoy the freshness of fruits
may more naturally flow into preferring a fruity or citrus-based e-liquid. It’s about finding the kind
of flavor you are most likely to enjoy.

Nicotine and Nicotine-Free E-Liquids: Making a Choice

Another important aspect in the selection of e-liquid is whether you will go with a nicotine-
containing solution or not. The nicotine-based e-liquids are quite popular among the people getting
switched from smoking to vaping, as they provide a similar experience to smoking traditional
cigarettes. As a new vaper looking to quit smoking, you might want to start with a nicotine-
containing e-liquid.  Once you become more accustomed to vaping, you can gradually lower the
nicotine content, perhaps trying something like 3 mg vape juice to make the transition even
smoother without feeling a sudden drop in nicotine levels. Other people would settle for those
without nicotine, maybe because they have quit or would simply want to enjoy the flavor without
the addictive product. Most vape product manufacturers of repute, including Vaporesso and Naked
100, offer both nicotine and nicotine-free options. This gives you leeway to make the adjustment as
your needs may dictate.

Brand Reputation and Ingredient Quality

Finally, one should not forget brand reputation regarding e-liquids and quality ingredients. Well-
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known brands, like Kraze Vape, guarantee high-quality products because they are made from
ingredients of good standards within the industry. Opting for popular brands means you vape with
safe and quality products. This would mean a lot when it comes to something you take in through
inhalation. There are literally scores of variations in e-liquids, which range between those that are
very bad to others that are excellent. As such, one has to make sure he or she selects only products
from trusted manufacturers to avoid associated risks with low-quality alternatives.

Considering VG and PG Ratios

Besides what was mentioned above, another decision that you will make when it comes to
choosing e-liquids is the VG/PG ratio. Vegetable Glycerin (VG) and Propylene Glycol are two
major active ingredients of e-liquids that create the vapor upon heat by your vape device. One is
VG, which is sweeter and thicker, whereas PG is thinner and gives that kick to the throat just like
cigarette smoking. If you like great big clouds of vapor, you want to go with a higher VG ratio; it’s
smooth and it’s more substantial vapor. If you are looking for more of that throat hit, then you want
a higher PG content. Well worth the experimentation to find that one suited for your vaping style.

Intensity and Complexity of Flavor

Some e-liquids may be made for a single, simple flavor, while others can be more complex,
mingling numbers of tastes in one bottle. Besides, there’s the intensity of the flavor-the strong and
bold flavors that stay on the tongue, for some vapers at least, and at the other end of the scale,
subtle, less overpowering options. Being a complete newb in vaping, you might want to go with a
single-note flavor, mint, vanilla, or strawberry-as they are more recognizable and easy to handle.
Only when one gains enough experience in vaping can those complicated combinations that
combine, say, tobacco with caramel or fruits with menthol, be tried. One needs to find the right
balance between flavor intensity and complexity that fits his own personal taste.

Finally, choosing the right e-liquid flavor is quite personal, wherein, really, there is not one size
that fits all. Now, base your decision on your taste preferences, your nicotine needs, and VG/PG
ratio. Go ahead and make an educated decision that best fits your individual style, considering
other aspects like brand reputation. You might need to try different flavors before getting the one
that perfectly fits your needs. Remember, vaping is all about enjoying it. Married to the right e-
liquid, one’s vaping sessions could be sincerely flavorful, enjoyable, and satisfying parts of the
day.
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